
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 

 

Minutes of the 
Streetscene Policy Development and 

Review Panel 
 

(to be confirmed at the next meeting) 

 
Date: Thursday, 22 October 2015 
  
Venue: Collingwood Room - Civic Offices 

 
 

PRESENT:  

 Councillor L Keeble (Chairman) 
 

 Councillor Mrs S M Bayford (Vice-Chairman) 
 

Councillors: J M Englefield, J V Bryant, D M Whittingham, A Mandry 
(deputising for D C S Swanbrow) and Mrs K K Trott (deputising 
for D J Norris) 
 

 
Also 
Present: 

Councillor Miss T G Harper, Executive Member for Streetscene 
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1. APOLOGIES FOR ABSENCE  

 
Apologies of absence were received from Councillors D J Norris and D C S 
Swanbrow. 
 

2. MINUTES  
 
It was AGREED that the minutes of the Streetscene Policy Development and 
Review Panel held on 10 September 2015 be confirmed and signed as a 
correct record. 
 

3. CHAIRMAN'S ANNOUNCEMENTS  
 
There were no Chairman’s announcements. 
 

4. DECLARATIONS OF INTEREST AND DISCLOSURES OF ADVICE OR 
DIRECTIONS  
 
There were no declarations of interest made at this meeting. 
 

5. DEPUTATIONS  
 
There were no deputations made at this meeting. 
 

6. REVIEW OF WORK PROGRAMME 2015/16  
 
The Panel considered a report by the Director of Environmental Services 
which reviewed the Panel’s work programme for 2015/16. 
 
Members were reminded that the report on Review of Bin Charging Policy that 
is scheduled for the 3 March 2016 may be removed from the work programme 
for 2015/16 due to the Vanguard Intervention that is about to start in 
Streetscene. 
 
Councillor Bryant referred to item 6 of the previous minutes which stated that 
he had suggested that a report on Project Integra be added onto the work 
programme. The Chairman addressed the Panel and informed them that he is 
currently in discussion with the Chairman of Scrutiny Board to decide on which 
Committee this report will go to. 
 
It was AGREED that the work programme for 2015/16, as set out in Appendix 
A of the report, be approved. 
 
 

7. ANNUAL REPORT ON RECYCLING PERFORMANCE  
 
The Panel considered a report by the Director of Environmental Services 
which provided an update on the annual performance of recycling in the 
Borough. 
 
Councillor Englefield joined the meeting during this item. 
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The Panel noted that the biggest change that has occurred during the past 12 
months is the removal of paper banks across the Borough. 
 
Councillor Mandry raised an issue with the garden waste collection service, 
where there are problems with the crews securing the sacks once they have 
been emptied. The Refuse Recycling and Transport Manager informed the 
Panel that the they provide constant training with the crews to ensure that they 
provide a good customer service to the residents of the borough who are using 
this service. 
 
It was AGREED that the content of the report be noted. 
 

8. PUBLIC TOILET REFURBISHMENT 5 YEAR PROGRAMME  
 
The Panel considered a report by the Director of Environmental Services on 
the 5 year programme for the public toilet refurbishment. 
 
The Chairman enquired when the Barry’s Meadow toilets were going to be 
replaced. He was informed that planning permission has been granted for the 
works but as of yet there is no planned start date. 
 
Councillor Mandry put forward a suggestion that all of the women’s public 
toilets be provided with a hook on the back of the door where ladies are able 
to hand their bag or shopping on. The Public and Open Spaces Manager 
confirmed that many of the public toilets already provide this facility but she 
would look into the feasibility of providing it in all of the public toilets. 
 
Councillor Trott referred to the minutes of the last meeting where she had 
raised the issue of the provision of public toilets at Bath Lane. She enquired 
again as to whether this is something that could be looked at again in the 
future. The Chairman reminded members that the toilets were closed originally 
due to the vandalism that occurred in them and that if they were to be 
reopened that the cost to maintain the facility would be too great. Councillor 
Trott suggested that the Council look into sponsorship of the toilets which 
would then provide the revenue needed to maintain the facility. The Director of 
Environmental Services addressed the Panel and suggested that he make 
enquires with other authorities to see if they provide such a service and if they 
do how well it is working.  
 
It was AGREED that the content of the report be noted. 
 

9. ANNUAL REPORT ON GROUNDS MAINTENANCE PERFORMANCE  
 
The Panel considered a report by the Director of Environmental Services on 
an annual review of the Grounds Maintenance service. 
 
The Chairman passed his thanks on to the crew who are currently planting 
outside of the Civic Offices, for the great job they are doing and for engaging 
with residents whilst carrying out their work. 
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Councillor Mrs Bayford enquired about Muslim Burials. The Operations 
Manager informed the Panel that they had recently had a request from the 
Muslim Community to provide cover for burials during evenings, weekends 
and bank holidays, however for the Council to provide this would be extremely 
costly and not feasible in the current financial climate for the Council to do. 
Therefore they are currently looking into the possibility of a contractor 
providing this service, or in the long term the Muslim Community to have their 
own Cemetery where they will be able to undertake their own burials. 
 
It was AGREED that the content of the report be noted. 
 

(The meeting started at 6.00 pm 
and ended at 6.52 pm). 

 
 


